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What would it be like if you lived in the White House? Dee Dee, Jose, and Annie are about to find out!
When their class takes a field trip to 1600 Pennsylvania Avenue, the three accidentally knock George
Washington out of his portrait and into real life, which turns their everyday tour into an unexpected
adventure! As they try to get the nation's first President back into his painting, the kids come across other
famous White House residents, including Abraham and Mary Todd Lincoln, Dolley Madison, and Jackie
Kennedy. Through their madcap journey, they realize that the White House isn't just a tourist attraction--it's
also a home.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Frazier:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Chasing George
Washington (Kennedy Center Presents: Capital Kids)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize
beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree
with their opinion or you have other opinion?

Sidney Robertson:

Often the book Chasing George Washington (Kennedy Center Presents: Capital Kids) will bring you to the
new experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to
find new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book Chasing George Washington (Kennedy Center
Presents: Capital Kids) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Sandra Fritz:

Why? Because this Chasing George Washington (Kennedy Center Presents: Capital Kids) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will zap you with the secret the item
inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way
makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning
thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it.
This book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have such as help improving your talent and your
critical thinking method. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Michael Larose:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It
is referred to as of book Chasing George Washington (Kennedy Center Presents: Capital Kids). You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make
you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one
location to other place.
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