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Interest in KwaZulu-Natal’s battlefields – especially those of the Anglo-Zulu War – has soared since the film
Zulu first screened in 1964, followed by Zulu Dawn in 1979 (the centenary of the Anglo-Zulu War).

During the centenary, the famous battlefields of Isandlwana and Rorke’s Drift were made ‘tourist-friendly’
by the then Natal Provincial Administration and controls were put in place by the heritage authorities to
prevent relics from being plundered. Supported by effective marketing from the Battlefield Route
Association and the KwaZulu-Natal Provincial Tourism Authority, the battlefields have become a must-see.
Indeed, Rorke’s Drift has become a tourist icon.

Specialist battlefield guides have been trained and are considered to be among the best in the world. New
hotels and lodges have been built with battlefield tourism resulting in the creation of an estimated 7,500
permanent jobs in what is termed the Battlefield Region. There are, of course, many more Anglo-Zulu War
sites to be seen: Discovering the Battlefields will enable visitors to find them and to read an account that is
not too lengthy yet has sufficient content to bring it to life. GPS coordinates will enable those wishing to
undertake a journey of exploration. The book is also a useful training manual for prospective battlefield
guides.

Above all, however, the author shares his knowledge gleaned from over 50 years of researching the Anglo-
Zulu War. He has blended firsthand accounts passed on from participants on both sides to subsequent
generations with official or newly researched information that has become available in recent years. It is
written in a style that is neither technical nor dramatic, is extensively illustrated with photographs of
personalities and places and includes comprehensive maps of all the battle sites.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Roland:

The book Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting strain or
having big problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book Discovering the Battlefields of the
Anglo-Zulu War for being your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like wide open and read
a guide Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Troy Cochran:

What do you concerning book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
really need something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored
faster. And you have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should
answer that question because just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Discovering
the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War to read.

David Clark:

This Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be
a successful person, why. The reason of this Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War can be one
of many great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but feed
anyone with information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is definitely handy,
you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed
ones. Beside that this Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War forcing you to have an enormous
of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your
day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Barbara Watson:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War your mind will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be your mind
friends. Imaging each word written in a guide then become one type conclusion and explanation that will
maybe you never get before. The Discovering the Battlefields of the Anglo-Zulu War giving you a different
experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for your better life in this
particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind are going to
be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary



shelling out spare time activity?
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