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Jeanne DuPrau's The City of Ember meets Louis Sachar's Holes in this imaginative and hilarious middle
grade novel from New York Times bestselling author Michael Perry.

When the world started to fall apart, the government gave everyone two choices: move into the Bubble
Cities…or take their chances outside. Maggie's family chose to live in the world that was left behind.
Deciding it's time to grow up and grow tough, Maggie rechristens herself "Ford Falcon"—a name inspired by
the beat-up car she finds at a nearby junkyard. Ford's family goes to this junkyard to scavenge for things they
can use or barter with the other people who live OutBubble. Her family has been able to survive this brave
new world by working together. But when Ford comes home one day to discover her home ransacked and
her family missing, she must find the strength to rescue her loved ones with the help of some unlikely
friends.

The Scavengers is a wholly original tween novel that combines an action-packed adventure, a heartfelt
family story, and a triumphant journey of self-discovery in a world where one person's junk is another
person's key to survival. Katherine Applegate, author of the Newbery Medal winner The One and Only Ivan,
raves "Michael Perry pulls out all the stops in this colorful tale."
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From reader reviews:

Gail Brasfield:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice
by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high. To suit your
needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this kind of The Scavengers book as beginner and
daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Kathryn Botello:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled The
Scavengers your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe not
known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a book then
become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get ahead of. The The Scavengers
giving you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful details for your
better life in this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will
probably be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Patricia Howland:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Scavengers why because the amazing cover that make you
consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Darren Perez:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This reserve The Scavengers was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to
add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a
new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era
like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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