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In What’s Left of the Left, distinguished scholars of European and U.S. politics consider how center-left
political parties have fared since the 1970s. They explore the left’s responses to the end of the postwar
economic boom, the collapse of the Soviet Union, the erosion of traditional party politics, the expansion of
market globalization, and the shift to a knowledge-based economy. Their comparative studies of center-left
politics in Scandinavia, France, Germany, southern Europe, post–Cold War Central and Eastern Europe, the
United Kingdom, and the United States emphasize differences in the goals of left political parties and in the
political, economic, and demographic contexts in which they operate. The contributors identify and
investigate the more successful center-left initiatives, scrutinizing how some conditions facilitated them,
while others blocked their emergence or limited their efficacy. In the contemporary era of slow growth, tight
budgets, and rapid technological change, the center-left faces pressing policy concerns, including
immigration, the growing population of the working poor, and the fate of the European Union. This
collection suggests that such matters present the left with daunting but by no means insurmountable
challenges.
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Drake:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you read,
if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular What's Left of the Left:
Democrats and Social Democrats in Challenging Times is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious
experience.

Jennifer Larson:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of information. Even you love What's Left of the Left: Democrats and Social
Democrats in Challenging Times, you could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to
miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout people. What? Still don't have it, oh
come on its identified as reading friends.

Elisa Hall:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more
time to be go through. What's Left of the Left: Democrats and Social Democrats in Challenging Times can
be your answer because it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time problems.

Wendy Cort:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you
know that little person like reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous
books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims What's Left of the Left: Democrats
and Social Democrats in Challenging Times.
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