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Millions of people around the world today spend portions of their lives in online virtual worlds. Second Life
is one of the largest of these virtual worlds. The residents of Second Life create communities, buy property
and build homes, go to concerts, meet in bars, attend weddings and religious services, buy and sell virtual
goods and services, find friendship, fall in love--the possibilities are endless, and all encountered through a
computer screen. At the time of its initial publication in 2008, Coming of Age in Second Life was the first
book of anthropology to examine this thriving alternate universe.

Tom Boellstorff conducted more than two years of fieldwork in Second Life, living among and observing its
residents in exactly the same way anthropologists traditionally have done to learn about cultures and social
groups in the so-called real world. He conducted his research as the avatar "Tom Bukowski," and applied the
rigorous methods of anthropology to study many facets of this new frontier of human life, including issues of
gender, race, sex, money, conflict and antisocial behavior, the construction of place and time, and the
interplay of self and group.

Coming of Age in Second Life shows how virtual worlds can change ideas about identity and society.
Bringing anthropology into territory never before studied, this book demonstrates that in some ways humans
have always been virtual, and that virtual worlds in all their rich complexity build upon a human capacity for
culture that is as old as humanity itself. Now with a new preface in which the author places his book in light
of the most recent transformations in online culture, Coming of Age in Second Life remains the classic
ethnography of virtual worlds.
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Cervantes:

Here thing why this kind of Coming of Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually
Human are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good however it depends
in the content of computer which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Coming of Age in Second Life:
An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human giving you information deeper as different ways, you can
find any book out there but there is no publication that similar with Coming of Age in Second Life: An
Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your
current eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is
easy to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. For anyone who is having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Coming of Age in Second Life: An
Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human in e-book can be your alternative.

Beverly Turner:

Coming of Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human can be one of your basic
books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary
which could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the
information. The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing Coming of
Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human yet doesn't forget the main place,
giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one of it. This great
information can easily drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Steven Murray:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Coming of Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human offer you a new
experience in examining a book.

Roman Morris:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. That Coming of Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores
the Virtually Human can give you a lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book you have thing
that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by



knowing more than some other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We need to have Coming of
Age in Second Life: An Anthropologist Explores the Virtually Human.
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