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Learn to allocate scarce library resources to meet learning, research, and service goals!How can you buy
more books and journals with less money, while also installing the latest software and hardware, paying staff
to train faculty and students in its use, offering the new round-the-clock information services users demand,
and redefining the traditional collection-centered model of the library? It sounds impossible, but these are the
conflicting imperatives every collections librarian faces at the dawn of the twenty-first century. Collection
Development in the Electronic Environment offers solid, practical advice from the experience of other
librarians who have met the same challenges, as well as useful information from vendors. Based on the
conference Collection Development in the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities, this informative book
suggests proven, effective strategies to deal with a librarian's most pressing problems. One case study shows
how Iowa State University turned a cutback in journals into a new vision of what the library should be,
involving a broad-based committee in the project. Other chapters discuss the specifics of budgeting for the
unpredictable pricing of electronic materials, the increased demands on library staff, and the challenges of
maintaining dual libraries--the electronic and the paper-based--both facing expensive issues of
preservation.Collection Development in the Electronic Environment offers help and advice on the most
complex and difficult issues librarians confront:

planning changes in library structure, function, and activities●

building new models for collection development●

identifying and fulfilling the needs of scholars in various disciplines●

redefining staff roles and responsibilities●

setting priorities in journal purchases●

using electronic innovations to enhance collection development●

dealing with copyright, fair use, and intellectual property in electronic formats●

Through case studies and firsthand experiences, Collection Development in the Electronic Environment 0.
provides you with the fresh ideas and proven strategies you need to guide your library into the electronic era.
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From reader reviews:

William Fiscus:

Within other case, little people like to read book Collection Development in the Electronic Environment:
Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration). You can choose the best book if you love reading a
book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book Collection Development in the
Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration). You can add know-how and
of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize
everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple
thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by
internet system. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Maurice Henkel:

This Collection Development in the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library
Administration) book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you
receive by reading this book is information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get details which is
getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That Collection Development in the Electronic
Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration) without we realize teach the one who
reading through it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become worry Collection Development in
the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration) can bring when you are
and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even
mobile phone. This Collection Development in the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of
Library Administration) having excellent arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Maria Huffman:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
examine. Collection Development in the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library
Administration) can be your answer because it can be read by anyone who have those short spare time
problems.

Jenna Quintana:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book Collection Development in the
Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration) to make your own personal
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you just like reading. Try to



choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It
is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and read it. Beside that the guide Collection
Development in the Electronic Environment: Shifting Priorities (Journal of Library Administration) can to be
a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of that time.
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