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The long-awaited second novel in Todd Robinson's Anthony Award-nominated Boo and Junior series

When a waitress at The Cellar asks Boo and Junior to scare off her roommate Dana’s harassing ex-boyfriend,
Byron, Boo’s white-knight impulses kick in and they perform the job with gusto—leaving Byron bloodied
but very much alive. So when Byron is found dead, they’re shocked. They’re even more shocked when they
learn that nothing is what they originally thought, and they're being held accountable in the death.

With Junior called in for questioning, Boo determines to clear their names by finding Byron’s true killer. It’s
a quest in which Boo will have to face down crooked cops, crazed guard dogs, a rival security crew, the Irish
mob and—worst of all—his own ingrained prejudices.

Action-packed, outrageously funny, and brutally honest, Rough Trade brings back crime fiction’s favorite
bouncers and takes them well out of their comfort zone.
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From reader reviews:

Cleveland Wheeler:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book called Rough
Trade? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time along with
your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different
opinion?

Marie Walsh:

This Rough Trade are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The reason of this
Rough Trade can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple
looking at food but feed an individual with information that might be will shock your preceding knowledge.
This book is handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and
printed types. Beside that this Rough Trade giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate
in reading.

Jacqueline Lewis:

The publication with title Rough Trade includes a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a
lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You can
read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Nancy Kidder:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be read.
Rough Trade can be your answer given it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time
problems.
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